
Bid Tabulation: 

RFB 39-03DEC20 - Inmate ServPro of Marshall, Sedalia, & 

Uniforms - Term & Supply 
Bob Barker Co., Inc. Charm-TeH, Inc. Kiesler Police Supply 

Columbia 
Unipak Com 

Bid Tabu lation QTY 

4.10.1 Institutional Trousers • $ 7.35 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Medium - Black & White Horizontal 
20 

Str ipes 

4.10.1 Extended by 20 $ 147.00 $ 127.20 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AH Items 

1 

4.10.2 Institutional Trousers - Large - $ 7.35 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & White Horizontal Stripes 
20 

4.10.2 Extended by 20 $ 147.00 $ 127.20 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.3 Institutiona l Trousers -X- $ 7.35 s 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid AH Items No Bid All Items 

Large - Black & White Horizontal 
40 

Stripes 

4.10.3 E><tended by 40 $ 294.00 s 254.40 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.4 Institutional Trousers -2X- $ 7.35 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & White Horizontal Stripes 
20 

4.10.4 E>< tended by 20 $ 147.00 $ 127.20 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.5 Institutional Trousers -3X- $ 7.35 $ 6.54 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & Whit e Horizontal Stripes 
10 

4.10.5 Extended by 10 $ 73.50 s 65.40 No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items No Bid Alt Items 

1 

4.10.6 Institutional Trousers -4X - $ 8.00 s 6.72 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & White Hor izontal Stripes 
5 

4.10.6 Extended by 5 $ 40.00 $ 33.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.7 Institutional Trousers -6X- $ 8.00 s 6.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & Wh ite Horizontal Stripes 
5 

4.10.7 Extended by 5 $ 40.00 s 34.50 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.8 Institutional Trousers -8X - $ 10.00 $ 7.54 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & Wh ite Hori zontal Stripes 
5 

4.10.8 Extended by S $ 50.00 $ 37.70 No Bid Alt Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.9 lnstitutional Trousers -9X - $ 10.00 $ 7.72 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Black & White Horizontal Stripes 
5 

4.10.9 Extended by 5 $ 50.00 $ 38.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.10 Institutional Trousers -lOX- $ 10.00 $ 7.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 

Black & Wh ite Horizontal Stripes 
5 

4.10.10 E><tended by 5 $ 50.00 $ 39.50 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.11. BLACK AND WHITE $ 1,038.50 $ 885.30 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

INSTITUTIONAL TROUSERS TOTAL 

(Extended prices for items 4.10.1 1 

through 4.10.10 added together) 

4.10.12 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 5.65 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid Alt Items 

M edium- Black & White Horizontal 
20 

Stripes 

4.10.12 Extended by 20 s 113.00 $ 118.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 
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Bid Tabulation: 
RFB 39-03DEC20 - Inmate ServPro of Marshall, Sedalia, & 

Uniforms - Term & Supply 
Bob Barker Co., Inc, Charm-Tex, Inc. Kiesler Police Supply 

Columbia 
Unipak Com 

Bid Tabulation QTY 

4.10.13 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 5.65 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
Large - Black & White Horizontal 

Stripes 
20 

4.10.13 Extended by 20 $ 113.00 $ 118.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.14 lnstitutional V-Neck Shirts -X- $ 5.95 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
Large - Black & White Horizontal 

40 
Stripes 

4.10.14 Extended by 40 $ 238.00 $ 236.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 

1 

4.10.15 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 6.00 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
2X - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

20 

4.10.15 Extended by 20 $ 120.00 $ 118.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.16 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 6.00 $ 6.18 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
3X - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

10 

4.10.16 Extended by 10 $ 60.00 $ 61.80 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.17 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 6.25 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
4X - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

5 

4.10.17 Extended by 5 $ 31.25 $ 31.80 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.18 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 6.85 $ 6.54 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
6X - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

5 

4.10.18 Extended by S $ 34.25 $ 32.70 No Bid AU Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.19 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 8.00 $ 6.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
BX - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

5 

4.10.19 Extended by 5 $ 40.00 $ 34.50 No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.20 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 8.00 $ 7.00 No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items No Bid Alt Items 
9X - Black & White Horizontal Stripes 

5 

4.10.20 Extended by 5 $ 40.00 $ 35.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.21 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 8.00 $ 7.18 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

lOX - Black & White Horizontal 
5 

Stripes 

4.10.21 Extended by 5 $ 40.00 $ 35.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.22. BLACK AND WHITE $ 829.50 $ 821.70 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

INSTITUTIONAL V-NECK SHIRTS TOTAL 

(Extended prices for items 4.10.12 
1 

throueh 4.10.21 added to ether} 

4.10.23 TOTAL FOR ALL BLACK & $ 1,868.00 $ 1,707.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

WHITE ITEMS REQUESTED 

(Add together the totals from items 
1 

4.10.11. + 4.10.22.l 

4.10.24 Institutional Trousers - $ 7.00 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Medium- Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.24 htended by 10 s 70.00 $ 63.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.25 Institutional Trousers -Large- $ 7.00 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Green No Lettering 
10 
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Bid Tabulation: 

I 

RFB 39-03DEC20 - Inmate ServPro of Marshall, Sedalia, & 

Uniforms - Term & Supply 
Bob Barker Co., Inc. Charm-Tex, Inc. Kiesler Police Supply 

Columbia 
Unipak Com 

I 

Sid Tabulation QTY 

4.10.25 Extended by 10 $ 70.00 $ 63.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.26 lnstitutionaf Trousers -X- $ 7.00 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Large- Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.26 Extended by 10 $ 70.00 $ 63.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.27 Institutional Trousers -2X - $ 7.00 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Sid All Items 

Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.27 Extended by 10 $ 70.00 $ 63.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.28 Institutional Trousers -3X - $ 7.50 $ 6.54 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.28 Extended by 10 $ 75.00 $ 65.40 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.29 Institutional Trousers -4X - $ 8.00 $ 6.72 No Bid AU Items No Bid AU Items No Bid AU Items 

Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.29 Extended by 10 $ 80.00 $ 67.20 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.30 Institutional Trousers -6X- $ 8.00 $ 6.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Green No lettering 
10 

4.10.30 Extended by 10 $ 80.00 $ 69.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.31 Institutional Trousers -sx- $ 10.35 $ 7.54 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.31 Extended by 10 $ 103.50 $ 75.40 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.32 Institutional Trousers -9X- $ 10.35 $ 7.72 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
Green No Lettering 

10 

4.10.32 Extended by 10 $ 103.50 $ 77.20 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.33 Institutional Trousers -lDX - $ 10.75 $ 7.90 No Bid All Items No Bid AH Items No Bid All Items 

Green No lettering 
10 

4.10.33 Extended by 10 $ 107.50 $ 79.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.34 GREEN INSTITUTIONAL $ 831.50 $ 687.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

TROUSERS TOTAL 

(Extended prices for items 4.10.24. 
1 

throueh 4.10.33. added tof;!:ether) 

4.10.35 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 5.35 $ 5.90 No Bid Alt Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Medium - Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.35 Extended by 10 $ 53.50 $ 59.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 
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Bid Tabulation: 

I 

RFB 39-03DEC20 - Inmate ServPro of M arshall, Sedalia, & 
Uniforms - Term & Supply 

Bob Barker Co., Inc. Charm-Tex, Inc. Kiesler Police Supply 
Columbia 

Unipak Com 

Bid Tabulation QTY 

4.10.36 Institut ional V-Neck Shirts - $ 5.35 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items No Bid All Items 
Large- Green No lettering 

10 

4.10.36 Extended by 10 $ 53.50 $ 59.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.37 Institutional V-Neck Shirts -X- $ 5.35 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
Large- Green No Lettering 

10 

4.10.37 Extended by 10 $ 53.50 $ 59.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.38 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 5.35 $ 5.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 
2X- Green No lettering 

10 

4.10.38 Extended by 10 s 53.50 s 59.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.39 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - s 6.00 s 6.18 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
3X- Green No Letter ing 

10 

4.10.39 Extended by 10 s 60.00 $ 61.80 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.40 Institutional V-Neck Shi rts - $ 6.00 $ 6.36 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 
4X- Green No Letter ing 

10 

4.10.40 Extended by 10 s 60.00 s 63.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.41 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - $ 7.00 s 6.54 No Bid Alt Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

6X- Green No Lett ering 
10 

4.10.41 Extended by 10 s 70.00 s 65.40 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

1 

4.10.42 Institutiona l V-Neck Shirts - s 9.00 s 6.90 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 

BX- Green No Lettering 
10 

4.10.42 Extended by 10 s 90.00 s 69.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

I 

4.10.43 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - s 9.00 s 7.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU It ems 
9X- Green No lettering 

10 

4.10.43 Extended by 10 s 90.00 s 70.00 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 

I 

4.10.44 Institutional V-Neck Shirts - s 9.00 s 7.18 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AU Items 

lOX- Green No lettering 
10 

4.10.44 Extended by 10 s 90.00 s 71.80 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid At1 Items 

1 

4.10.45 GREEN INSTITUTIONAL V- s 674.00 s 637.60 No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

NECK SHIRTS TOTAL 

(Extended prices for it ems 4.10.35 
1 

t hroue:h 4.10.44 added toe:etherl 
4.11.1.1 Renewal Option 2% 7% No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid AH It ems 

Percentage Price Adjustment 
1 

1st Renewa l Period 

4.11.1.2 Renewal Opti on 2% 7% No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Percentage Price Adjustment 

2nd Re newal Period 
1 

4. 11.1.3 Renewa l Option 4% 7% No Bid All Items No Bid All Items No Bid All Items 

Percentage Price Adjustmen t 

3rd Renewa l Pe riod 
1 

4.11.1.4 Renewal Option 4% 7% No Bid All Items No Bid Alt Items No Bid All Items 

Percentage Price Adjustment 

4th Renewal Period 
1 

Co-Op - Yes/No 
Unknown Unknown 
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